
BDS BID REQUEST 24-01-BAND UNIFORMS-MOSLEY HIGH
OPENED: DECEMBER 6, 2023 

BIDDERS COAT BIBBERS HELMET PLUMES HELMET 
BOX HANGERS GARMENT 

BAGS
BAND 
TOTAL DM TOTAL BID TOTAL

De Moulin $345.55 $117.24 $93.34 $23.21 NC $1.88 $14.00

x150 = $51,832.50 $17,586.00 $14,001.00 $3,481.50 $0.00 $282.00 $2,100.00 $89,283.00 $2,820.32 $92,103.32

Fruhauf $323.20 $98.70 $89.95 $49.75 NO BID $2.23 $11.75

x150 = $48,480.00 $14,805.00 $13,492.50 $7,462.50 NO BID $334.50 $1,762.50
$86,337.00 $2,222.32 $88,559.32

Stanbury $305.40 $108.95 $115.00 $44.20 $15.00 NC $14.25
x150 = $45,810.00 $16,342.50 $17,250.00 $6,630.00 $2,250.00 NC $2,137.50 $90,420.00 $2,753.80 $93,173.80

BIDDERS COAT BIBBERS HELMET PLUMES HELMET 
BOX HANGERS GARMENT 

BAGS

UNIFORM 
MGMT 

SYSTEM
DM TOTAL TOTAL BID 

COST 

De Moulin $451.85 $117.24 $96.90 $23.21 NC $1.88 $14.00 NC

x4 = $1,807.40 $468.96 $387.60 $92.84 NC $7.52 $56.00 NC $2,820.32

Fruhauf $323.20 $98.70 $69.95 $49.75 NO BID $2.23 $11.75 NC

x4 = $1,292.80 $394.80 $279.80 $199.00 NO BID $8.92 $47.00 NC $2,222.32

Stanbury $350.00 $140.00 $125.00 $44.20 $15.00 NC $14.25 NC
x4 = $1,400.00 $560.00 $500.00 $176.80 $60.00 NC $57.00 NC $2,753.80

REGULAR BAND UNIFORMS - 150 EACH

DRUM MAJOR UNIFORMS - 4 EACH

OPENED BY: __________________________________________________________________________________________________DATE:  ______________________________________          
                    Jacqueline Dorman/Susan Beauchene          


	Sheet1

